

Results	Last Name	First Name	MI	Street	City	Twp., Village	State	Zip Code	Parcel #	Acres	Case #	Plaintiff	Minimum Bid	Sale Date
No Bid No Sale	Blair	Harry	N	White Oak Dr	Auburn	Auburn Twp	Ohio	44023	01-118102	0.32	11F001014	Christopher P. Hitchcock, Treasurer of Geauga County	\$301.63	09/12/13 09/26/13
No Bid No Sale	M&G Construction			Wood Acre Tr	Auburn	Auburn Twp	Ohio	44023	01-118320	0.54	11F001014	Christopher P. Hitchcock, Treasurer of Geauga County	\$3,267.12	09/12/13 09/26/13
Sold to Harriet Sugar 152.80	Wantz	Ronald	E	Riverwood Ln	Auburn	Auburn Twp	Ohio	44023	01-118889	0.62	11F001014	Christopher P. Hitchcock, Treasurer of Geauga County	\$152.80	09/12/13 09/26/13
No Bid No Sale	Cammon	Anne W. & Willie		S/L 1294 Woodland Ave	Chagrin Falls	Bainbridge Twp	Ohio	44023	02-054300	0.06	11F001014	Christopher P. Hitchcock, Treasurer of Geauga County	\$736.31	09/12/13 09/26/13
No Bid No Sale	Cammon	Anne W. & Willie		S/L 1296 Woodland Ave	Chagrin Falls	Bainbridge Twp	Ohio	44023	02-054400	0.06	11F001014	Christopher P. Hitchcock, Treasurer of Geauga County	\$736.31	09/12/13 09/26/13
No Bid No Sale	Cammon	Anne W. & Willie		S/L 1295 Woodland Ave	Chagrin Falls	Bainbridge Twp	Ohio	44023	02-054500	0.06	11F001014	Christopher P. Hitchcock, Treasurer of Geauga County	\$736.31	09/12/13 09/26/13
No Bid No Sale	Bey	Sabra Marie Williams & Charles Omarr Carron		S/L 1151 Huron St	Chagrin Falls	Bainbridge Twp	Ohio	44023	02-235700	0.06	11F001014	Christopher P. Hitchcock, Treasurer of Geauga County	\$503.59	09/12/13 09/26/13
No Bid No Sale	Bey	Sabra Marie Williams & Charles Omarr Carron		S/L 1154 Huron St	Chagrin Falls	Bainbridge Twp	Ohio	44023	02-235800	0.06	11F001014	Christopher P. Hitchcock, Treasurer of Geauga County	\$503.59	09/12/13 09/26/13
No Bid No Sale	Bey	Sabra Marie Williams & Charles Omarr Carron		S/L 1152 Huron St	Chagrin Falls	Bainbridge Twp	Ohio	44023	02-235900	0.06	11F001014	Christopher P. Hitchcock, Treasurer of Geauga County	\$503.59	09/12/13 09/26/13
No Bid No Sale	Bey	Sabra Marie Williams & Charles Omarr Carron		S/L 1153 Huron St	Chagrin Falls	Bainbridge Twp	Ohio	44023	02-236000	0.06	11F001014	Christopher P. Hitchcock, Treasurer of Geauga County	\$479.54	09/12/13 09/26/13
No Bid No Sale	Walker	Dennis, Gertrude, Dennis Jr. & Thomasina		S/L 558 Elyria St	Chagrin Falls	Bainbridge Twp	Ohio	44023	02-383500	0.06	11F001014	Christopher P. Hitchcock, Treasurer of Geauga County	\$620.12	09/12/13 09/26/13
No Bid No Sale	Walker	Dennis, Gertrude, Dennis Jr. & Thomasina		S/L 559 Elyria St	Chagrin Falls	Bainbridge Twp	Ohio	44023	02-383600	0.06	11F001014	Christopher P. Hitchcock, Treasurer of Geauga County	\$620.12	09/12/13 09/26/13

Results	Last Name	First Name	MI	Street	City	Twp., Village	State	Zip Code	Parcel #	Acres	Case #	Plaintiff	Minimum Bid	Sale Date
No Bid No Sale	Tentler	William A Tentler, Dianne C. Kwiatkowski & David B.		S/L 166 Parkway	Burton	Burton Twp	Ohio	44021	04-135800	0.1	11F001014	Christopher P. Hitchcock, Treasurer of Geauga County	\$368.56	09/12/13 09/26/13
No Bid No Sale	Tentler	William A Tentler, Dianne C. Kwiatkowski & David B.		S/L 167 Parkway	Burton	Burton Twp	Ohio	44021	04-135900	0.1	11F001014	Christopher P. Hitchcock, Treasurer of Geauga County	\$368.63	09/12/13 09/26/13
Sold to Robert Stephenson 169.30	Boorn	Malcolm	R	Kinsman Rd	Middlefield	Burton Twp	Ohio	44062	04-150919	0.16	11F001014	Christopher P. Hitchcock, Treasurer of Geauga County	\$169.30	09/12/13 09/26/13
Sold to Choosers Inc., 212.88	Worthington	Ruth		Clark Rd	Chardon	Chardon Twp	Ohio	44024	06-120280	0.86	11F001014	Christopher P. Hitchcock, Treasurer of Geauga County	\$212.88	09/12/13 09/26/13
No Bid No Sale	Baker	Hosea		Auburn Rd	Chardon	Chardon Twp	Ohio	44024	07-001526	0.22	11F001014	Christopher P. Hitchcock, Treasurer of Geauga County	\$212.32	09/12/13 09/26/13
Sold to Choosers Inc., 261.39	Oakton Inc			Lot 60-61 Center St	Chardon	City of Chardon	Ohio	44024	10-053261	0.14	11F001014	Christopher P. Hitchcock, Treasurer of Geauga County	\$261.39	09/12/13 09/26/13
No Bid No Sale	Oakton Inc			126 Center St	Chardon	City of Chardon	Ohio	44024	10-053270	0.32	11F001014	Christopher P. Hitchcock, Treasurer of Geauga County	\$7,302.17	09/12/13 09/26/13
Sold to Linda Gifford 1250.00	Kunecki	Joan	P	Spruce Dr	Chesterland	Chester Twp	Ohio	44026	11-262461	0.47	11F001014	Christopher P. Hitchcock, Treasurer of Geauga County	\$336.10	09/12/13 09/26/13
No Bid No Sale	Eldred	Ester	I	Lot 80 D Cornelia Dr	Chardon	Aquilla Vill	Ohio	44024	14-027600	0.07	11F001014	Christopher P. Hitchcock, Treasurer of Geauga County	\$210.38	09/12/13 09/26/13
No Bid No Sale	ELdred	Ester	I	Lot 79 D Cornelia Dr	Chardon	Aquilla Vill	Ohio	44024	14-027500	0.07	11F001014	Christopher P. Hitchcock, Treasurer of Geauga County	\$257.69	09/12/13 09/26/13
No Bid No Sale	Vlk	Ann		S/L 15 Aquilla Blvd	Chardon	Aquilla Vill	Ohio	44024	14-054100	0.07	11F001014	Christopher P. Hitchcock, Treasurer of Geauga County	\$147.76	09/12/13 09/26/13
No Bid No Sale	Vlk	Ann		S/L 16 Aquilla Blvd	Chardon	Aquilla Vill	Ohio	44024	14-054200	0.07	11F001014	Christopher P. Hitchcock, Treasurer of Geauga County	\$147.76	09/12/13 09/26/13
No Bid No Sale	Vlk	Ann		S/L 21 Aquilla Blvd	Chardon	Aquilla Vill	Ohio	44024	14-054300	0.07	11F001014	Christopher P. Hitchcock, Treasurer of Geauga County	\$147.76	09/12/13 09/26/13
No Bid No Sale	Fehlner	Alice		Woodbury Dr	Newbury	Newbury Twp	Ohio	44065	23-092600 23-385334	0.13	11F001014	Christopher P. Hitchcock, Treasurer of Geauga County	\$555.95	09/12/13 09/26/13
No Bid No Sale	Luempert	Irwin		Castlewood Dr	Newbury	Newbury Twp	Ohio	44065	23-196100	0.07	11F001014	Christopher P. Hitchcock, Treasurer of Geauga County	\$405.22	09/12/13 09/26/13
No Bid No Sale	Toth	Thomas	J	Zenith Dr	Newbury	Newbury Twp	Ohio	44065	23-326400	0.07	11F001014	Christopher P. Hitchcock, Treasurer of Geauga County	\$336.39	09/12/13 09/26/13
No Bid No Sale	Hosmer	Frank		Castlewood Dr	Newbury	Newbury Twp	Ohio	44065	23-385335	0.06	11F001014	Christopher P. Hitchcock, Treasurer of Geauga County	\$147.32	09/12/13 09/26/13
No Bid No Sale	Doubler	Albertine		Woodbury Dr	Newbury	Newbury Twp	Ohio	44065	23-385337	0.06	11F001014	Christopher P. Hitchcock, Treasurer of Geauga County	\$147.32	09/12/13 09/26/13

For complete parcel information, please click the parcel number link above.

Results	Last Name	First Name	MI	Street	City	Twp., Village	State	Zip Code	Parcel #	Acres	Case #	Plaintiff	Minimum Bid	Sale Date
No Bid No Sale	Rebick	Steve		Castlewood Dr	Newbury	Newbury Twp	Ohio	44065	23-385338	0.05	11F001014	Christopher P. Hitchcock, Treasurer of Geauga County	\$147.32	09/12/13 09/26/13
No Bid No Sale	Lewis Development Co			Russell Rd	Chagrin Falls	Russell Twp	Ohio	44022	28-022403	0.02	11F001014	Christopher P. Hitchcock, Treasurer of Geauga County	\$251.90	09/12/13 09/26/13